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Color Harmony 2 is an invaluable tool for anyone working with color. From graphic designers to interior
decorators, from fashion designers to floral arrangers, this book can help anyone create effective color
schemes for any project.

Colors and color schemes matched to specific moods provide unique color and design possibilities. 12 basic
hues with 94 tints and shades give over 1400 color combinations in single, two, and three-color schemes.
Vivid color photographs illustrate many different color combinations. Color swatches and a color conversion
chart assure easy and accurate color matching. Easy-to-follow lessons in basic color theory.
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From reader reviews:

David Crockett:

The book Color Harmony 2: A Guide to Creative Color Combinations has a lot of information on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous
author. This articles author makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to
read you can obtain the point easily after reading this book.

Ronnie Hamilton:

Color Harmony 2: A Guide to Creative Color Combinations can be one of your beginning books that are
good idea. We recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that could increase
your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The
writer giving his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Color Harmony 2: A
Guide to Creative Color Combinations however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest
along with based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information
may drawn you into brand new stage of crucial imagining.

Evelyn White:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can
know everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This book Color Harmony 2: A Guide to Creative Color Combinations was filled in
relation to science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some
people has various feel when they reading any book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can
really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book you wanted.

Doreen Looney:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you also
know that little person including reading or as examining become their hobby. You should know that reading
is very important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book. Different
categories of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra Color Harmony 2: A Guide to
Creative Color Combinations.
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