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What sorrow lurks in the minds of men suffering from a broken heart? Ain’t No Sunshine knows! How do
men feel when they lose someone they love? Do they cry? Do they obsess? Do they call psychics? Under the
protection of anonymity, thirty-eight men describe in detail how they’ve dealt with the pain of heartbreak.
Whether it's because of divorce, betrayal, death or simply getting dumped, the raw honesty of these men may
surprise you. Modern American society so often discourages men from admitting to emotional pain,
especially when it comes to matters of the heart. From an early age men are taught to "suck it up." Women
often think men have it easier when it comes to the pain of heartbreak. But is that really the case? Ain't No
Sunshine provides an opportunity to unlock those mysteries in this informal collection of stories. Interviews
with therapists, psychics and bartenders are included and provide informative insights into how men react to
a broken heart. Love is never easy. Loss of love is always difficult. Here is proof that not only do men
struggle, sometimes the struggle is more difficult than it is for women. Ain't No Sunshine is a rare glimpse
into the elusive male psyche
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Gonzales:

The book Ain't No Sunshine: Men Reveal the Pain of Heartbreak give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your
spare time. You should use to make your capable far more increase. Book can for being your best friend
when you getting stress or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading through a book
Ain't No Sunshine: Men Reveal the Pain of Heartbreak to become your habit, you can get far more
advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You
are able to know everything if you like start and read a reserve Ain't No Sunshine: Men Reveal the Pain of
Heartbreak. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other
individuals. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Ronald Hopkins:

Now a day folks who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not involve people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Studying a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Ain't No Sunshine: Men Reveal the
Pain of Heartbreak book as this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the details in this book
hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Adriana Phillips:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This
reading habit give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on
what kind of publication you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning
books but if you want truly feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining for example comic or
novel. The Ain't No Sunshine: Men Reveal the Pain of Heartbreak is kind of publication which is giving the
reader capricious experience.

Tia Rosario:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
when compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find
guide that need more time to be go through. Ain't No Sunshine: Men Reveal the Pain of Heartbreak can be
your answer because it can be read by you actually who have those short extra time problems.
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