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This book takes readers right into the heart of how the people of South Sudan at all levels were able through
thick and thin to sustain one of the longest civil wars and wars of liberation in Africa. Sudan’s conflict has a
lot of complexities and this book examines these dating back from their origins. In doing so it attempts to
reconstruct a democratic reconciliatory model similar to that of other democratic African countries for
Sudanese people in this post-war era. Apart from the freedom fighters, the authors also confirm that
traditional leaders have played an unprecedented role during the South Sudan liberation struggle which was
characterised by huge material, political mobilisation and human capital support. Political reconciliation and
traditional leadership liberation struggle in South Sudan: Critical issues for consideration, re-awakens and
reclaims the historiography and legacy of the liberation struggle which cannot be forgotten. The authors have
an ‘up close and personal, unapologetic view’ of the issues at hand which gives added authority to this
immensely well researched work. This thought-provoking book is a must read for scholars, practitioners,
civilians and interested parties alike. Most importantly, it was also written in commemoration of the gallant
fallen heroes and martyrs including all those who sacrificed their souls and died for the South Sudan
liberation struggle. Aluta continua!
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From reader reviews:

Stanley Wells:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, the actual best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't wish do that. You must know how great and important the book Liberation Struggle In South
Sudan. All type of book are you able to see on many options. You can look for the internet options or other
social media.

Maria Blanco:

This Liberation Struggle In South Sudan are generally reliable for you who want to be a successful person,
why. The reason of this Liberation Struggle In South Sudan can be one of several great books you must have
is giving you more than just simple examining food but feed a person with information that possibly will
shock your previous knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your
conditions at e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Liberation Struggle In South Sudan forcing you to
have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we
all know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Karen Strange:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This book Liberation Struggle In South Sudan was filled regarding science. Spend your time
to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has different feel when
they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can experience enjoy to read
a reserve. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Marianne Stromain:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the most effective book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever simply by
searching from it. It is named of book Liberation Struggle In South Sudan. You'll be able to your knowledge
by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read.
It is most crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination to other
place.
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