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"an invaluable guide for practitioners, quality assurors, university managers and students themselves who
wish to better understand the importance of assessment for learning, and it will further scholarship in the
field significantly."

-Professor Sally Brown

 Assessment for Learning in Higher Education is a practical guide to Assessment for Learning (AfL); a term
that has become internationally accepted in Higher Education and features in the learning and teaching
strategies of many universities. It is also mandated by official bodies such as QAA in the UK. Many staff in
Higher Education are uncertain about how to implement AfL, especially in times of increasingly constrained
resources and this vital new guide provides solutions that make best use of assessment as a tool for learning.

This book provides an important and accessible blend of practical examples of AfL in a variety of subject
areas. The authors present practical, often small-scale and eminently ‘do-able’ ideas that will make its
introduction achievable. It provides practical case examples both for new lecturers and more experienced
staff who may be interested in embedding AfL principles and practice into their university teaching. AfL
approaches go beyond minor adaptations to teaching practice, and signify a shift in the foundations of
thinking about assessment. With this in mind there is guidance on the development of effective learning
environments and communities through the use of:

collaboration and dialogue❍

authentic assessment ❍

formative assessment ❍

peer and self assessment ❍

student development for the long term ❍

innovative approaches to effective feedback . ❍

It provides helpful, realistic guidance backed up by relevant theory and is written in an accessible, jargon-
free style, grounded in practical experience and brought to life via a wide range of illustrative examples and
case studies.

Assessment for Learning in Higher Education fills a vital gap in assessment literature and as AfL is
increasingly on the Higher Education agenda, with the promotion of assessment as a tool for learning, this
book will become an essential handbook to guide all academic practitioners.
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From reader reviews:

George Cardenas:

Here thing why that Assessment for Learning in Higher Education are different and trustworthy to be yours.
First of all reading through a book is good however it depends in the content of it which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. Assessment for Learning in Higher Education giving you information deeper and in
different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no publication that similar with Assessment for
Learning in Higher Education. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your current eyes about the
thing that happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is possible to bring
everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your means home by train. In case you are having
difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Assessment for Learning in Higher Education
in e-book can be your alternative.

Maria Asbury:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their story or their
experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about the information
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their skill in
writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this Assessment
for Learning in Higher Education.

Eileen Matherly:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This Assessment for Learning in Higher
Education is simple to create you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not
include much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you easier to
read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when you buy this book.

Peter Singleton:

As a college student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library
or to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul or real
their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful pics on
there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know that on this
time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this Assessment for Learning in Higher Education can make you sense more interested to read.
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