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Exciting futuristic Young Adult novel with a strong heroine and a compelling storyline from award -
winning Fleur Beale. Winner of the Esther Glen Award 2009 and shortlisted for the 2009 NZ Post Children's
Book Awards Young Adult category. It explores the struggle of Juno, a young teen on the verge of
adulthood, who is torn between her need to fit in and belong in her society, and her growing discomfort and
questioning of that society's rules. Your ordinary teen? Not quite! Because Juno lives - in the not - too -
distant future - on Taris, a bubble - covered island in the Pacific, to which a select few hundred people were
evacuated when Earth's inhabitants took everything just a bit too far and began to self - destruct. On Taris
there are many rules governing appearance, behaviour, even procreation ... but all are for the good of the
community, to ensure the survival of humankind. Or are they? As Taris' protected environment begins to
break down and Juno's questioning nature takes hold, she uncovers some startling inconsistencies in many of
the 'factual' histories she has grown up with. She also begins to develop some quite startling, almost
supernatural, abilities. As Juno faces increasing danger, she finds allies in the most surprising places. Juno of
Taris examines many themes: peer pressure, environmental breakdown, the fictionalization of history,
societal control and challenging authority but perhaps most of all, it is a thoroughly good read from one of
our very best writers for young adults.
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From reader reviews:

Ellen Farnsworth:

The book Juno of Taris give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your
capable considerably more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting strain or having
big problem along with your subject. If you can make examining a book Juno of Taris to be your habit, you
can get considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about some or all
subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like start and read a reserve Juno of Taris. Kinds of book
are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this
guide?

Miguel Willis:

Here thing why this specific Juno of Taris are different and trusted to be yours. First of all reading through a
book is good but it really depends in the content of computer which is the content is as delightful as food or
not. Juno of Taris giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any book out there
but there is no guide that similar with Juno of Taris. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your
own eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. It is
easy to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your technique home by train. Should you be having
difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Juno of Taris in e-book can be your choice.

Susan Crowell:

Reading a book for being new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you study a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you
have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, along with soon. The Juno of Taris will give
you a new experience in looking at a book.

Carol Hamilton:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information easier to share. You
can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
can view that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended for
you is Juno of Taris this reserve consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This
specific book was represented how do the world has grown up. The words styles that writer require to
explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some research when he makes this book.
Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.
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