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A Captivating, Behind-the-Scenes Look at the Making of a Premium California Wine

Situated amidst the lush soils of Sonoma County in the heart of California’s wine country, the Ferrari-Carano
Vineyards produce some of the best-loved wines in America. Founded by casino mogul Don Carano and his
wife Rhonda just over twenty years ago, the winemaker has won praise from consumers and connoisseurs
alike for its affordably priced premium bottles, particularly its Fumé Blanc. In A Very Good Year, award-
winning journalist Mike Weiss goes behind the scenes at this renowned winemaker to tell the story of how a
bottle of this wine is created, from the first grapes picked by the hands of Mexican migrant workers to the
vintage’s initial public tasting at the Four Seasons in New York.

Weiss’s intimate look at the 2002 Fumé Blanc reveals the delicate interaction between water, sunlight, soil,
and climate that produces grapes with the precise flavors sought by its growers—as well as explaining how a
winemaker’s decisions during the fermenting processes can bring out subtle changes in the distinctive
flavors, such as the grassy melon bouquet that is the hallmark of this vintage. Weiss also looks at how "The
Story" of a winery drives its marketing identity, is reflected in such decisions as the shape of its bottle and
the style of its label, and can often decide the crucial difference of whether it is included on the lists of the
country’s best white-tablecloth restaurants. Along the way, A Very Good Year brings to life the colorful
characters behind Ferrari-Carano: an obsessive fourth-generation vineyard manager who can predict an early
spring based on the behavior of local bass; a star winemaker who must decide the precise blending methods
based on elaborate chemistry and a supposition of what reviewers want to taste; the effusive sales and
marketing guru behind the powerful brand; and at the center of it all is Don Carano, a successful
entrepreneur who has entered the wine business not as a millionaire dilettante but as an ambitious winemaker
with an eye toward creating a vintage that will garner international acclaim.

Insightful and intoxicating, A Very Good Year is a delight to be savored by the oenophile and novice alike.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Hamlin:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book titled A Very Good Year: The
Journey of a California Wine from Vine to Table? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside
you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its
opinion or you have various other opinion?

Betty Smith:

Here thing why that A Very Good Year: The Journey of a California Wine from Vine to Table are different
and reliable to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good but it depends in the content of computer
which is the content is as yummy as food or not. A Very Good Year: The Journey of a California Wine from
Vine to Table giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there
is no book that similar with A Very Good Year: The Journey of a California Wine from Vine to Table. It
gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing this happened in the world
which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in
your means home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of A
Very Good Year: The Journey of a California Wine from Vine to Table in e-book can be your option.

Kelly Brooks:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with their story or
even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve
their ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of them is this A
Very Good Year: The Journey of a California Wine from Vine to Table.

Betty Freeman:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic in the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your
cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you
want to test look for book, may be the e-book untitled A Very Good Year: The Journey of a California Wine



from Vine to Table can be fine book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.
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