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Fachhochschule, Veranstaltung: Project Management Tools and Organisation , Sprache: Deutsch, Abstract:
While a project is a form of organisation which is characterised through its uniqueness, its novelty and a
fixed end date, a virtual project team is distributed over different locations worldwide, but working together
as one team. Remote communication between the team members is done through synchronous and
asynchronous means of virtual communication. Because these media cannot transmit the full bandwidth of
human communication, there must be rules set how to act with these different means of virtual
communication in order to prevent frustration and communication problems. Additional difficulties may
arise when a virtual project team is composed of people with different cultural backgrounds. In such a case, a
project manager of a virtual team has to join communication skills with intercultural skills. In order to work
together under these circumstances, team building is crucial to make a virtual project a success. Successful
team building in a virtual project first of all means that people with the right characteristics have to be chosen
to form a virtual project team. For example, they must have a high level of self-organisation and social
competence. Furthermore, building trust is crucial in order to make people who may never see each other in
real life successfully work together. In order to manage the task of a virtual project, a project manager of
such a team needs a high level of social skills coupled with the skills of a motivator. The Blended Delivery
model of Logica, a global provider of IT services, where a local core team works together with an extended
virtual team, may be a good compromise between virtual and non-virtual project work and may combine
benefits of bot
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From reader reviews:

Eva Stanfield:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need more
time to be read. Managing Virtual Project Teams (German Edition) can be your answer mainly because it
can be read by you who have those short free time problems.

James Sanford:

Beside that Managing Virtual Project Teams (German Edition) in your phone, it could give you a way to get
nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from
oven so don't be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Managing
Virtual Project Teams (German Edition) because this book offers to your account readable information. Do
you often have book but you do not get what it's about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this
within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do
you still want to miss that? Find this book and read it from right now!

Guadalupe Marshall:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This Managing Virtual Project Teams (German Edition) can give
you a lot of friends because by you looking at this one book you have factor that they don't and make a
person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This reserve
offer you information that might be your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than various other make
you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have Managing Virtual Project Teams (German
Edition).

Pablo McNamara:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source that filled update of news.
In this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social just like
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just in search
of the Managing Virtual Project Teams (German Edition) when you desired it?
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