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Fundamentals of Nonlinear Optics encompasses a broad spectrum of nonlinear phenomena from second-
harmonic generation to soliton formation. The wide use of nonlinear optical phenomena in laboratories and
commercial devices requires familiarity with the underlying physics as well as practical device
considerations. This text adopts a combined approach to analyze the complimentary aspects of nonlinear
optics, enabling a fundamental understanding of both a given effect and practical device applications.

After a review chapter on linear phenomena important to nonlinear optics, the book tackles nonlinear
phenomena with a look at the technologically important processes of second-harmonic generation, sum-
frequency and difference-frequency generation, and the electro-optic effect. The author covers these
processes in considerable detail at both theoretical and practical levels as the formalisms developed for these
effects carry to subsequent topics, such as four-wave mixing, self-phase modulation, Raman scattering,
Brillouin scattering, and soliton formation.

Consistently connecting theory, process, effects, and applications, this introductory text encourages students
to master key concepts and to solve nonlinear optics problems—preparing them for more advanced study.
Along with extensive problems at the end of each chapter, it presents general algorithms accessible to any
scientific graphical and programming package.

Watch the author speak about the book.
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From reader reviews:

William Ullrich:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
walk, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled Fundamentals of
Nonlinear Optics? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time
with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have some
other opinion?

Martha Doughty:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Fundamentals of Nonlinear
Optics book as nice and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Justin Belz:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this reserve. This Fundamentals of Nonlinear Optics is
simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not possess much
space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save
the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

James Scott:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This book Fundamentals of Nonlinear Optics was vibrant and of
course has pictures around. As we know that book Fundamentals of Nonlinear Optics has many kinds or
type. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe
you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers up you
feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading that.
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