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This paper explores an area of tertiary education that is currently understudied?the extent and nature of
differentiation and articulation in African tertiary education systems. The overall finding of the study is that a
binary system is dominant, characterized by universities and polytechnics as distinct types of institutions.
Differentiation is clearly evident in Africa, though mostly horizontal as opposed to vertical. Articulation, on
the other hand, seems to be in its infancy, as some universities, in their admission requirements, do not
recognize polytechnic qualifications, and mobility between similar institution types is rare. National policy,
market forces, institutional reforms, industry, and regional initiatives drive differentiation. Resource
constraints, isomorphism, governance and funding structures, and the absence of debate over size and shape
act as inhibitors. Demand for access appears to be the only driver for articulation, while national policies,
internal governance structures, and industry/labor market inhibit growth.
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From reader reviews:

William Bellard:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Differentiation and Articulation in Tertiary Education Systems: A Study of
Twelve Countries (World Bank Working Papers). Try to make the book Differentiation and Articulation in
Tertiary Education Systems: A Study of Twelve Countries (World Bank Working Papers) as your good
friend. It means that it can being your friend when you feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter
than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you considerably more confidence
because you can know anything by the book. So , let me make new experience and knowledge with this
book.

Brian Bauer:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or details even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you
is you don't know what one you should start with. This Differentiation and Articulation in Tertiary Education
Systems: A Study of Twelve Countries (World Bank Working Papers) is our recommendation to make you
keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Della Ferguson:

This book untitled Differentiation and Articulation in Tertiary Education Systems: A Study of Twelve
Countries (World Bank Working Papers) to be one of several books in which best seller in this year,
honestly, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy
this specific book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by using online. The publisher in this book sells
the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Cell
phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this reserve from your list.

Rita Merritt:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's soul or real their leisure
activity. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing reading
really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is
being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this time, many ways to get
whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this
Differentiation and Articulation in Tertiary Education Systems: A Study of Twelve Countries (World Bank



Working Papers) can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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