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Published together for the first time, Eliza Haywood’s Anti-Pamela and Henry Fielding’s An Apology for the
Life of Mrs. Shamela Andrews are the two most important responses to Samuel Richardson’s novel Pamela.
Anti-Pamela comments on Richardson’s representations of work, virtue, and gender, while also questioning
the generic expectations of the novel that Pamela establishes, and it provides a vivid portrayal of the material
realities of life for a woman in eighteenth-century London. Fielding’s Shamela punctures both the figure
Richardson established for himself as an author and Pamela’s preoccupation with virtue.

This Broadview edition also includes a rich selection of historical materials, including writings from the
period on sexuality, women’s work, Pamela and the print trade, and education and conduct.
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From reader reviews:

Connie King:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material if you want something
to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person?
If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer that question
because just their can do in which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
suitable. Because start from on guardería until university need this particular Anti-Pamela and Shamela
(Broadview Literary Texts) to read.

Ellen Weiss:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or information even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to a person is
you don't know what kind you should start with. This Anti-Pamela and Shamela (Broadview Literary Texts)
is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and
need in this era.

Theodore Stewart:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold
on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Anti-Pamela and Shamela (Broadview Literary Texts) book is
readable through you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for
enjoyable studying experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you.
The writer associated with Anti-Pamela and Shamela (Broadview Literary Texts) content conveys prospect
easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it
just different such as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Anti-Pamela and Shamela (Broadview Literary
Texts) is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Alfonso Miller:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This particular Anti-Pamela and Shamela (Broadview Literary
Texts) can give you a lot of close friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have point that
they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to
get success. This book offer you information that might be your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more
than various other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We should have Anti-Pamela and Shamela
(Broadview Literary Texts).
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