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The knowledge that an unseen energy flows through all living things and directly affects the quality of health
has been part of the wisdom of many cultures since ancient times. The existence of this "life energy" has
been verified by recent scientific experiments, and medical doctors are considering the role it plays in the
functioning of the immune system and the healing process.

Reiki, a technique for stress reduction that also promotes healing, allows everyone to tap into an unlimited
supply of "life energy." Reiki was discovered by Dr. Mikao Usui, a Japanese Buddhist, early in the 20th
Century. Reiki is easy to learn. It has been successfully taught to thousands of people of all ages and
backgrounds. A treatment feels like a wonderful glowing radience that flows through you and surrounds you.
It creates many beneficial effects including relaxation and feelings of peace, security and well being. Many
have reported miraculous results. Hospitals and doctors' offices are beginning to include it as part of their
therapy, and this new edition describes several successful approaches now being used across the US to
integrate Reiki into patient care.

This revised and expanded edition includes important new information on the theory and practice of Reiki,
including the Japanese Reiki Techniques taught by Dr. Usui as well as the Hayashi healing guide. Also
included are pictures of the Usui Memorial in Tokyo, and of Mt. Kurama where Reiki was rediscovered.

This book is a must for anyone wanting the latest information on Reiki. Its referenced history of Reiki
contains the most detailed and verfiable information currently available. Written with inspiration, clarity and
vitality, it captures the essence of Reiki and is an excellent introduction to the subject as well as a user-
friendly manual for the experienced practitioner.
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From reader reviews:

Joaquin Hogan:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their reader with their story or
even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the data
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there
are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their proficiency in
writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this Reiki: The Healing
Touch - First and Second Degree Manual.

Troy Jones:

Reiki: The Healing Touch - First and Second Degree Manual can be one of your basic books that are good
idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that may increase
your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The
article writer giving his/her effort to place every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Reiki: The
Healing Touch - First and Second Degree Manual nevertheless doesn't forget the main point, giving the
reader the hottest along with based confirm resource information that maybe you can be considered one of it.
This great information can certainly drawn you into new stage of crucial pondering.

Kevin Roark:

As a student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's spirit or real their
interest. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading significantly. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Reiki: The Healing Touch - First and Second Degree Manual can make
you experience more interested to read.

Lillian Kea:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And also you
know that little person just like reading or as examining become their hobby. You should know that reading
is very important as well as book as to be the point. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this Reiki: The
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